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CB-P48.
KRÜPPEL LIKE FACTOR 6 IS AN IMPORTANT 
TRANSCRIPTIONAL REGULATOR OF TROPHOBLAST 
DIFFERENTIATION 
Racca AC, Camolotto S, Ridano ME, Genti-Raimondi S, Panzetta-
Dutari GM. 
CIBICI-CONICET, Fac Cs Químicas, UNCórdoba. Córdoba. 
Argentina.  E-mail: aracca@fcq.unc.edu.ar 

KLF6 is a ubiquitous zinc finger transcription factor involved in 
differentiation, cell cycle control and proliferation in several cell 
systems. Even though its highest expression has been detected in 
human and mice placenta, its function in trophoblast physiology is 
still unknown. During pregnancy, placental villous cytotrophoblast 
cells (CTB) proliferate and differentiate by fusion to form the 
syncytiotrophoblasts layer characterized by a high metabolic and 
biosynthetic activity. In this work, we postulate KLF6 as an 
important transcription factor that regulates the expression of genes 
implicated in trophoblast differentiation. KLF6 expression raised 
within the first hours of in-vitro syncytialization preceding cell 
fusion and expression of ßhCG and PSG genes, early markers of 
trophoblast differentiation. Over expression of KLF6 in 
trophoblast-like JEG-3 cells increased the mRNA and protein levels 
of ßhCG and PSG, as revealed by qRT-PCR and western blot assays. 
Most importantly, down-regulation of KLF6 expression by siRNA 
experiments before the beginning of in-vitro syncytialization 
resulted in lower mRNA expression of trophoblast differentiation 
marker genes and inhibition of the CTB fusion process. In sum, 
these results represent the first direct evidence to propose KLF6 as a 
regulator of trophoblast differentiation.
Supported by CONICET, FONCyT, MinCyT of Córdoba and 
SECyT-UNC.

CB-P49.
DIPHENYL DISELENIDE MODULATES MACROPHAGE 
ACTIVATION BY DECREASING PRO- AND ANTI-
INFLAMMATORY  MARKERS 

1,2 2 1Rupil L , De Bem AF , Roth GA . 
1Dpto Quím Biológica-CIQUIBIC. Fac. Cs Quím UNC Argentina. 
2Centro Ciências Biológicas. UFSC. Brasil. E-mail: 
lrupil@fcq.unc.edu.ar 

The biological importance of selenium led to the development of 
pharmacologically active organoselenium compounds. Diphenyl 
diselenide (PhSe)2 is an organoselenium compound whose 
biological activities have been poorly described. Previously, we 
evaluated its antioxidant and anti-inflammatory properties in an in 
vitro model of inflammation. We found that (PhSe)2 was able to 
prevent the production of reactive oxygen species, nitric oxide, the 
expression of iNOS, the peroxynitrite modification of proteins 
(nitrotyrosine immunostaining) and the antigen presentation 
capacity of LPS stimulated macrophages (Mph). Next, we focused 
on studying the ability of (PhSe)2 to modulate the alternative 
activation of Mph, which encompasses an upregulation of anti-
inflammatory mediators. We isolated peritoneal Mph and 
stimulated them with dexamethasone to induce the alternative 
activation phenotype. We observed that activated Mph presented 
higher expression of IL-10, which was downregulated by (PhSe)2. 
Then, we examined the surface expression of mannose receptor 
(CD206), and found that dexamethasone treatment augmented the 
expression of CD206, while (PhSe)2 was able to downregulate this 
molecule. Finally, preliminary results indicate that (PhSe)2 
decreased the ratio of IL-10/IL-12 mRNA in dexamethasone 
treated Mph. These findings suggest that (PhSe)2 could be used to 
modulate the activation of Mph. 

CB-P50.
NICOTINIC ACETYLCHOLINE RECEPTOR CLUSTERS 
LOCALIZATION ON LIPID DOMAINS OF THE 
PLASMALEMMA 
Kamerbeek CB, Borroni MV, Pediconi MF, Barrantes FJ. 
Instituto de Investigaciones Bioquímicas de Bahía Blanca 
(INIBIBB-UNS-CONICET).  E-mail: ckamerbeek@criba.edu.ar 

In the present work we have attempted to establish whether there is 
a correlation between antibody-induced nicotinic acetylcholine 
receptor (AChR)-rich clusters and the physical state of the 
underlying cell membrane in living cells. For this purpose di-4-
ANEPPDHQ, a fluorescent probe that differentiates liquid-ordered 
from liquid-disordered phases in model membranes was used in 
combination with labeling of the AChR in CHO-K1/A5, a clonal 
cell line expressing adult muscle-type AChR. The so-called 
generalized polarization (“GP”) of di-4-ANEPPDHQ was 
measured in regions of the cell-surface membrane associated with 
the AChR platforms clearly identified using conventional wide-
field fluorescence microscopy. Under control conditions AChR 
clusters are roughly equally distributed among liquid-ordered and 
liquid-disordered domains. This distribution changes upon 
cyclodextrin-mediated cholesterol depletion or by Latrunculin 
disruption of the actin cytoskeleton. Association of AChR clusters 
with lipid domains with different biophysical properties may have 
consequences on AChR trafficking processes. 

CB-P51.
YACON LEAVES AMELLIORATE TGF-ß1/SMAD 
SIGNALING  IN  DIABETIC  KIDNEY 
Honoré SM, Genta SB, Sánchez SS. 
INSIBIO (CONICET-UNT). Chacabuco 461. T4000ILI – SM de 
Tucumán, Argentina.  E-mail: smhonore@fbqf.unt.edu.ar 

Nephropathy is a common cause of morbidity and mortality in 
diabetic patients. Prevention of this complication is clearly 
required. Smallanthus sonchifolius (yacon) leaves containing 
mainly polyphenolic acids and the lactone enhydrin have been 
shown to ameliorate hyperglycemia in streptozotocin-induced 
diabetic rats. In the present study, we examined the beneficial 
effects of yacon leaves decoction in diabetic kidney and explored 
the possible underlying mechanism.
Diabetic rats were orally administered with 10% yacon leaves 
water decoction (140mg dry extract/kg b.w.) for 30 days. 
B i o c h e m i c a l  p a r a m e t e r s  i n  b l o o d  a n d  u r i n e ,  
immunohistochemistry, western immunoblotting and qRT-PCR 
analysis were developed.
Yacon decoction significantly decreased high blood glucose level 
in diabetic rats and improved insulin production. Diabetic-
dependent alterations in urinary albumin excretion, creatinine 
clearance, kidney hypertrophy and basement membrane thickening 
were attenuated by yacon decoction. These findings were 
associated with a marked decrease in TGFß1, TGFRII and p-
Smad2/3. The expression of extracelullar matrix proteins as 
collagen IV, laminin-1, fibronectin and collagen III were also 
diminished in the yacon-treated group. These results suggest that 
yacon leaves is a protective agent against renal damage in diabetic 
nephropathy, whose action can be mediated by TGFß/Smads 
signals.

CB-P52.
IMPLICATION OF PKC ISOFORMS IN REVERSION OF 
MAMMARY TUMORS MALIGNANCY IN RESPONSE TO 
RETINOIC  ACID 
Díaz Bessone MI, Berardi DE, Campodónico PB, Cirigliano S, Bal 
de Kier Joffé ED, Todaro LB, Urtreger AJ. 
Research Area, Institute of Oncology "A. H. Roffo". E-mail: 
mariadiazbessone@hotmail.com 

In this work we have overeexpressed in LM3 murine mammary 
cells the a and d isoforms of PKC in order to study whether these 
genetically modified sublines are more sensitive to retinoid 
treatment (ATRA).
Through a reporter gene assay, using the retinoic acid responsive 
elements upstream luciferase gene (RARE-Luciferase), we could 
determine that only PKCd overexpression induced an increase in 
the activity of these sites. This result correlates with previous assays 
showing that PKCd traslocates to the nucleus coupled to retinoid 
receptors. ATRA effect was also studied in vivo and in vitro, 
evaluating parameters related to tumor growth and dissemination. 
While PKCa overexpression induced an important increase in the 
in vitro proliferative capacity, only these overexpressors become 
sensitive to ATRA treatment showing a proliferative delay. 
Moreover, LM3-PKCa cells also showed a higher migratory 
capacity, also reversed by retinoid treatment. In vivo assays showed 
that only PKCa overexpression induced an increase in tumor 
growth and metastatic potential, and ATRA treatment was able to 
limit the malignant progression of these tumors. Our results suggest 
that, PKCa overexpression confers a more aggressive phenotype 
but make the cells sensitive to ATRA effects, while PKCd is 
necessary for retinoid receptors traslocation but is insufficient to 
alter cellular response to retinoid treatment.

CB-P47.
EXPRESSION AND LOCALIZATION OF COMPLEXIN IN 
MOUSE  EGGS 
Bello OD, Zanetti MN, Rodríguez JF, Cappa AI, Mayorga LS, 
Michaut MA. 
Lab. de Biología Reproductiva, IHEM-CONICET, Fac. Cs. 
Médicas, Univ. Nac. Cuyo, Mendoza, Argentina. E-mail: 
odbello@fcm.uncu.edu.ar 

Cortical granule exocytosis is one of the most important steps, 
which occurs after sperm-egg fusion, at fertilization. Cortical 
granule exocytosis is induced by the spermatozoon and blocks 
polyspermy to enable a successful embryonic development. 
Induction of cortical granule exocytosis depends on intracellular 
calcium mobilization in the egg; however little is known about the 
signal transduction pathway downstream of calcium mobilization. 
Our general aim is to identify the proteins involved in cortical 
granule exocytosis, analyze their functions, and arrange them in a 
working model. We hypothesized that cortical granule exocytosis is 
controlled by a conserved protein machinery that involves 
SNAREs, Rabs, and additional proteins that are key for calcium-
regulated exocytosis, such as complexin. The aim of this work was 
to investigate the expression and localization of complexin in mouse 
eggs. Using an antibody that recognizes two isoforms of complexin, 
Western blots results demonstrated that complexin is expressed in 
mouse eggs. Immunofluorescence studies showed that complexin 
localized specifically at the cortical region of mouse eggs, which is 
enriched in cortical granules. Our results suggest that complexin 
might be involved in cortical granule exocytosis. However, further 
studies are necessary to identify the specific isoform/s of complexin 
expressed in mouse eggs.

CB-P45.
CHARACTERIZATION OF ADP RIBOSYLATION 
FACTORS EVIDENCE AN ATYPICAL GOLGI APPARATUS 
IN  Giardia  lamblia 
Ferrari ML, Rivero FD, Lujan HD. 
School of Medicine, Catholic University of Cordoba. Cordoba. 
Argentina. E-mail: marianaluciaferrari@gmail.com 

Giardia lamblia is an intestinal parasite that belongs to the earliest 
diverging branch of the eukaryotic lineage of descent. Giardia 
appears as a “living fossil” since it has neither typical mitochondria, 
peroxisomes, nor a classical Golgi apparatus (GA). Although both 
constitutive and regulated pathways for protein secretion exist in 
Giardia, little is known about the molecular mechanisms involved 
in vesicular traffic. An exhaustive search of the complete Giardia 
genome identified genes for seven giardial ARF proteins (ADP 
Ribosylation Factors), one RER1 (Retention in Endoplasmic 
Reticulum 1) and one p24 (cargo receptor). The expression and 
localization of these proteins evidenced colocalization with specific 
markers for distinct subcellular organelles. Interestingly, ARF4 
(ORF:13930) and RER1 (ORF:15413), in addition to SNAREs Qb1 
and Qb2, displayed a vesicular pattern different from typical Giardia 
subcompartments, and colocalized with heterologous markers for 
the GA. Additionally, treatment with fungal toxin Brefeldin-A 
evidenced partial dissociation from these vesicular structures and 
redistribution of ARF4 and RER1 into the ER. Our results not only 
contribute to understanding the complex system of vesicular 
trafficking but also suggest the existence of a structurally atypical 
Golgi apparatus, capable of carrying out the functions of packaging 
and sorting of proteins in Giardia

CB-P46.
PLASMID DNA CLEAVAGE AND CYTOTOXICITY OF 
VO(oda)phen COMPLEX ON NORMAL AND TUMOR 
LINES  IN CULTURE 

1 2 1 2 1León IE , Butenko N , Baran E , Cavaco I , Etcheverry SB . 
1 2Fac, Cs. Exactas, UNLP, Argentina; Depto Qca Bioqca e Fcia 
Univers idade do Algarve,  Faro Portugal .  E-mail:  
iel86@yahoo.com.ar 

Vanadium is a transition metal with chemical, biological and 
pharmacological interest due to insulin mimetics, antitumoral and 
osteogenic actions. Nevertheless, vanadium compounds may also 
show cytotoxic effects mainly due to the generation of oxidative 
stress and DNA damage. In this work we report the biological 
effects of a complex of vanadyl (IV) cation with two ligands 
(oxodiacetate and phenanthroline) of biological interest, on two 
osteoblastic cell lines, one normal (MC3T3-E1) and the other 
tumoral (UMR 106). The effects on cell proliferation (crystal violet 
bioassay), metabolic activity (MTT bioassay), lysosomal activity 
(neutral red) and morphology were investigated. Besides, we 
studied the mechanisms involved in the cyto- and genotoxicity 
(oxidative stress and DNA cleavage). The complex caused an 
inhibitory effect on both line proliferation at low doses with a 
stronger effect on MC3T3-E1 (p<0.001). Moreover it altered the 
lysosomal and mitochondria metabolisms (p< 0.001). 
Morphological studies showed important transformations and a 
decrease in the number of cells in a dose response manner. Besides, 
VO(oda)phen interacted with plasmidic DNA (pA1) causing single 
and double strand cleavage. Altogether, these results suggest that the 
complex is a candidate to be further evaluated for alternative 
therapeutics in cancer treatment


