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modulation. By contrast, the treatment with serine pro
teases inhibitors prevented the potentiation of  T cell 
activation induced by neutrophils. Moreover, the addition 
of elastase to  T cell culture increased their stimulation, 
and the treatment of neutrophils with elastase inhibitor 

prevented the effect of neutrophils on  T cell activation. 
Furthermore, we demonstrated that the effect of elastase 
on 
vated receptor, PAR1, since the inhibition of this receptor 

fect of neutrophils on  T cell activation. 
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CD8+

es that can induce rejection of solid tumors. In this pro
cess, dendriticcells (DCs) are thought to take up tumor 
antigens, which are processed into peptides and loaded 

lular pathways involved in vivo are clearly established 
because of the lack of experimental tools to manipulate 
thisprocess. To develop such tools, we generated mice 

gene, a criticalregulator of endoplasmic reticulum–pha

ex vivo and 
+ T cell responses in vivo. 

in DCs is required to initiate CD8+ T cell responses to 
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Acute kidney injury (AKI) is common in intensive care 
units. The mortality rate for hospitalized patients who 

out AKI. Despite the introduction of new therapies, the 
mortality associated with this pathology has improved 
little over the last years. The routinely available clinical 
parameters of kidney disease (plasma creatinine and 
urea) do not provide in practice either a sensitive or spe

the injury has occurred. Early detection of this pathology 
could permit implementation of salvage therapies and 
improve patient outcomes. Over the last years, tubular 
proteins released during tubular insult have garnered 
much attention as promising AKI urine biomarkers. Neu
trophil gelatinase associated lipocalin (NGAL), kidney in

(NAG) have demonstrated to be early predictors for di
agnosis or outcome of AKI in human as well as in animal 
models. Related to this issue, in the last years we have 

been trying to validate different proteins excreted in urine 
as noninvasive biomarkers of AKI of different etiologies. 
Our group was pioneering in detecting the Organic Anion 

urinary excretion of these proteins has been evaluated 
in different experimental models of renal diseases in 
rats and compared with traditional parameters of renal 
function (plasma urea and creatinine, creatinine clear
ance, urinary alkaline phosphatase activity, histological 
lesions). The results obtained in experimental models 

by methotrexate, cisplatin and mercuric chloride) allow 

markers of different stages of this disease. The next step 
would be passing from preclinical animal research to clin
ical trials in order to evaluate the utility of these proteins 
as biomarkers of AKI in humans.


